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Migraines are a common problem that can cause severe pain and disability.
While there are many medications available to treat migraines, some
people prefer to use natural home remedies. This article provides 10 home
remedies for fast migraine relief that are backed by scientific evidence.

1. Ginger

Ginger is a natural anti-inflammatory that can help to reduce the pain of
migraines. A study published in the journal Neurology found that ginger was
as effective as the prescription medication sumatriptan in treating
migraines.

To use ginger for migraine relief, you can:
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Drink ginger tea

Take ginger supplements

Apply ginger essential oil to your temples

2. Turmeric

Turmeric is another natural anti-inflammatory that can help to reduce the
pain of migraines. A study published in the journal Phytotherapy Research
found that turmeric was effective in preventing migraines in people who
were prone to them.

To use turmeric for migraine relief, you can:

Add turmeric to your food

Take turmeric supplements

3. Feverfew

Feverfew is a herb that has been used for centuries to treat migraines. A
study published in the journal The Lancet found that feverfew was effective
in reducing the frequency and severity of migraines.

To use feverfew for migraine relief, you can:

Drink feverfew tea

Take feverfew supplements

4. Magnesium



Magnesium is a mineral that is essential for many bodily functions,
including nerve function and muscle relaxation. A study published in the
journal Headache found that magnesium was effective in reducing the
frequency and severity of migraines.

To use magnesium for migraine relief, you can:

Eat foods that are rich in magnesium, such as leafy green vegetables,
nuts, and seeds

Take magnesium supplements

Apply magnesium oil to your skin

5. B vitamins

B vitamins are essential for energy production and nerve function. A study
published in the journal The American Journal of Clinical Nutrition found
that B vitamins were effective in reducing the frequency and severity of
migraines.

To use B vitamins for migraine relief, you can:

Eat foods that are rich in B vitamins, such as meat, poultry, fish, and
whole grains

Take B vitamin supplements

6. Peppermint oil

Peppermint oil is a natural pain reliever that can help to reduce the pain of
migraines. A study published in the journal International Journal of Clinical



Practice found that peppermint oil was effective in reducing the severity of
migraines.

To use peppermint oil for migraine relief, you can:

Apply peppermint oil to your temples

Diffuse peppermint oil in your home

Take peppermint oil supplements

7. Lavender oil

Lavender oil is a natural relaxant that can help to reduce the pain and
stress of migraines. A study published in the journal European Neurology
found that lavender oil was effective in reducing the severity of migraines.

To use lavender oil for migraine relief, you can:

Apply lavender oil to your temples

Diffuse lavender oil in your home

Take lavender oil supplements

8. Cold compress

A cold compress can help to reduce the pain and inflammation of
migraines. A study published in the journal Headache found that a cold
compress was effective in reducing the severity of migraines.

To use a cold compress for migraine relief, you can:

Apply a cold compress to your forehead



Apply a cold compress to the back of your neck

9. Hot compress

A hot compress can help to relax the muscles and reduce the pain of
migraines. A study published in the journal The Journal of Headache and
Pain found that a hot compress was effective in reducing the severity of
migraines.

To use a hot compress for migraine relief, you can:

Apply a hot compress to your forehead

Apply a hot compress to the back of your neck

10. Massage

Massage can help to relax the muscles and reduce the pain of migraines. A
study published in the journal The Journal of Alternative and
Complementary Medicine found that massage was effective in reducing the
frequency and severity of migraines.

To use massage for migraine relief, you can:

Massage your temples

Massage your neck

Massage your shoulders

Migraines can be a debilitating condition, but there are a number of home
remedies that can help to provide fast relief. The remedies listed in this



article are backed by scientific evidence and can be used safely and
effectively to reduce the pain and suffering of migraines.
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